STATE OF CONNECTICUT
OFFICE OF EARLY CHILDHOOD

CONTRACT AMENDMENT

Contractor: Capitol Region Education Council
Contractor Address: 111 Charter Oak Avenue

Contract Number: 12DDS0709BT

Amendment Number: Al

Amount as Amended: $19,000,000.00

Contract Term as Amended: 7/1/12-6/30/18

The contract between Capitol Region Education Council (zhe "Contractor”) and the Department of
Developmental Setvices (the "Agency”), which was last executed by the parties on effective date: 7/1/12, is hereby
amended as follows:

1. Effective July 1, 2015, the Contracting State Agency is changed from the Department of Developmental Services
to the Office of Eatly Childhood pursuant to Public Acts 14-39 and 15-5, and all references to “Department” or
“Department of Developmental Services” in the original contract and its subsequent amendments shall
henceforth tefer to the Office of Early Childhood.

2. The term of the contract is extended for an additional year and the end date of the contract is changed
from 6/30/17 to 6/30/18.

3. Part I, Sections 1.a and 1.b of this contract are hereby deleted and the following is substituted in lieu thereof:

Population: This contract is for the operation of a general and Deaf/Hard of Hearing, comprehensive Bitth to
Three Program serving all eligible childten also known as “Clients” as defined in Part II, Section A.5. The
Contractor shall only serve Clients in the towns as authorized on a list maintained by the Department and

available on the Department’s website www.ct.gov/oec.

Duration: The Contractor agtees to operate one or mote Birth to Three Programs (“Program”) for eligible
children, under the federal Individuals with Disabilities Education Act (“IDEA”)(34 CFR Part 303) and its
regulations, C.G.S. § 17a-248 and its regulations, and Birth to Three procedures and service guidelines
issued by the Department, as such statute, regulations, procedures, and guidelines may be amended from
time to time, for the term of this contract. This contract may be renewed up to an additional 5 years. Any
renewal of this contract shall require an amendment executed by the parties and approved as to form by the
Office of the Attorney General.

4. Effective July 1, 2017, Part I, Section 4 of this contract, is hereby deleted and the following is substituted in lieu
thereof:

4.

Thitd Party Billing.
a. Insurance and Medicaid:
1. The Contractor shall use the Department’s selected third party billing vendor per a

separate contract with the Department to file third party claims. The contracted billing
vendor will account for all third patty reimbursements.
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2. The Contractor shall provide complete and accurate insurance information on each child
in the Data Systems as defined in procedures.

3. In the event that a health insurance plan is directed by the Internal Revenue Service to
withhold reimbursement, the amount of the reimbursement will be credited by the
Department in the Department’s calculation of payments owed under this contract.

4. Contractor is requited to entoll in Medicaid.

5. Contractor is required to enroll with medical billing clearinghouse as directed by
contracted billing vendor.

6. Contractor is required to complete an initial and annual training with contracted billing
vendot.

7. The Contractor is the designated payee for commercial insurance, Medicaid and state

funds.

8. Contractor will agtee to accept payments through EFT (Electronic Funds Transfer).

5. The following sections are appended to Part 1, Section 6 of this contract:

6. Funding Identification.

a.

b.

The Contractor’s DUNS number is __06-189-6424

Federal funding has been provided for this contract as follows:

CFDA (Catalog of Federal Domestic Assistance) Title: Special Education Grants for Infants
and Families with Disabilities

CFDA Numbet: 84.181A

Award Name: Part C of the Individuals with Disabilities Education Act

Award Year: 2017

Research and Design: No

Name of Federal Agency Awarding: ~ U.S. Department of Education

Unless the Contractor submits to the Department previous wtitten authorization from the
Federal awarding agency prior to contract execution, the Contractor shall not exceed the default
10% cap on administrative costs for Federal funding allocated under this contract. All
administrative costs in excess of 10% of the total Federal funding amount will be disallowed.

Federal Office of Management and Budget Requirements.

i, This contract includes Federal Financial Assistance, and therefore such funds shall be
subject to the Federal Office of Management and Budget Cost Principles codified in the
OMB Super Circular as set forth in 2 C.F.R. pt. 200 and as updated from time to time.

1. Federal funding shall be released by the Department contingent upon receipt of federal
monies by the Department in compliance with the Federal Cash Management
Improvement Act (CMIA), 31 U.S.C. § 6501 et. seq.

Trafficking Victims Protection Act of 2000.

Pursuant to Section 106(g) of the Trafficking Victims Protection Act of 2000 as amended,

the Agency shall terminate this contract immediately and report such termination to HRSA
if it determines that the any of the employees or volunteers of the Contractor, or any of its
subcontractors or vendors, has perfotmed any of the following actions:
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6.

a) Engage in severe forms of trafficking in persons during the period of time that the
award is in effect;

b)  Procure a commercial sex act during the period of time that the award is in effect; or

) Use forced labor in the performance of the services under this contract.

Guidance on this act is available at http://www.hrsa.gov/grants trafficking.htm

f.  Pro-Children Act of 1994.

1.

In accordance with Patt C of Public Law 103-227, the “Pro-Children Act of 1994,”
smoking may not be permitted in any portion of any indoor facility owned or regulatly
used for the provision of health, day care, education, or library services to children under
the age of 18, if the services are funded by Federal programs, whether directly or through
State or local governments. Federal programs include grants, cooperative agreements, loans
and loan guarantees, and contracts. The laws does not apply to children’s services
provided in private residences, facilities funded solely by Medicare or Medicaid funds, and
portions of facilities and used for inpatient drug and alcohol treatment.

The above language must be included in any subawards that contain provisions for
children’s services and that all subgrantees shall certify compliance accordingly. Failure to
comply with the provisions of this law may result in the imposition of a civil monetary
penalty of up to $1,000.00 per day.

Effective July 1, 2017, Part I, Section 8 of this contract, is hereby deleted and the following is substituted in lieu

thereof:

Payments.

General Payment Method: The Contractor shall enter data related to billing within 10 days of
the event (Developmental Screening, Evaluation, Assessment, IFSP development and review,
and Farly Intervention Setvice). The Department shall pay for authorized services, not covered
by third party reimbursement, provided by qualified practitioners. Payment will be made
according to Birth to Three payment procedure posted on the Department’s website

www.ct.gov/oec.
Developmental Screening/ Evaluation: When so directed by the Department Contractors will

be paid for each developmental screening.

Evaluation: Contractors will be paid for each child’s completed initial evaluation provided that
the evaluation meets the requirements of being multidisciplinary and being administered by
qualified personnel located in the “Personnel Standards” procedure in the Birth to Three
Procedures on the Birth to Three website at www.birth23.org.

Development, Review, Update and Monitoring of the IFSP: Contractors will be paid for each
initial TFSP meeting at a rate established by the Department if the meeting is held on a separate
date from the initial evaluation/assessment and within 45 days of the referral to Child
Development Infoline (unless the meeting is delayed at the request of the family). Subsequent
reviews of the IFSP will be paid if documentation exists that they meet all requirements under
IDEA Part C.

Payment for Ongoing Early Intervention Services: Payment for services for a child new to the
system will begin as soon as the IFSP is signed by the child’s physician or advanced practice
registered nurse if required as indicated by data entry.

Payment for Those Services Required to be Provided at No Cost to the Family as Chosen by the
Family: For eligible children whose families choose to receive those services that are required to
be provided at no cost to the family, the Contractor will be paid for service coordination,
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h.

k.

evaluation, and IFSP development and evaluation. The Contractor will be paid a monthly rate
established by the Department, , and posted by July 1 of each year on the Department’s website
www.ct.gov/oec provided that the Contractor documents it in the data system and follows the

Birth to Three payment procedure posted on the Department’s website www.ct.gov/oec.

Assistive Technology:

1. The Program must seek third party reimbursement for the assistive technology device.
If third patty reimbursement pays for an appropriate device, the vendor and the
Contractor must accept that amount as payment in full. The Contractot will consult
with the assistive technology (AT) contractor identified by the Department prior to
requesting reimbursement for purchase of any assistive technology device other than a
hearing aid. The Contractor will contact the AT Contractor for refurbishment or
storage of any device where the price paid for the device used at least 51% of Birth to
Three funds provided through this contract and the child it was purchased for no longer
needs the device.

2. Upon contract cancellation, termination for cause or non-renewal, the Contractor shall
return any state-owned assistive technology devices to the Department.

Interpreting Services Other than Spanish: Upon prior approval from the Department, the
Contractor will be reimbursed monthly for 75% of the cost for interpreting services (for

languages other than Spanish) for that poztion of the interpretation fee that exceeds $250 per
month. The amount due to the Contractor will be invoiced by the Contractor to the
Depattment according to the Payment Procedure.

Monthly and One-time Payments: At the sole discretion of the Department, and within available
appropriations, a monthly per child or a one-time payment may be made to the Contractor for
the purpose of enhancing Program quality or to offset unforeseen Program costs beyond the
control of the Contractor.

IFSP Services Owed to Families that Transfer: If there are IFSP services that were not delivered
by the Contractor’s staff or subcontractors and the family has not given written consent in the
IFSP to forego those services priot to a family’s transfer to another Program, the sending
Program is responsible for those service hours as stated in Part I, Section 1.£.

Cash advance payments (as specified in Part I, Section 16 of this contract) made under this or a
prior contract will be applied against future amounts owed under this or any successor
agreement(s), upon notification of contract cancellation, termination for cause, ot non-renewal.
In the event that thete ate no such future amounts, the entire cash advance will be due to the
Depattment within 30 days of cancellation, termination for cause, or non-renewal of this
contract.

Part IT, Section E.1 of this contract, is hereby deleted and the following is substituted in lieu thereof:

E.1. Health Insurance Portability and Accountability Act of 1996.

@)

(®)

If the Contactor is a Business Associate under the requirements of the Health Insurance Portability
and Accountability Act of 1996 (“HIPAA”), as noted in this Contract, the Contractor must comply
with all terms and conditions of this Section of the Contract. If the Contractor is not a Business
Associate under HIPAA, this Section of the Contract does not apply to the Contractor for this
Contract.

The Contractor is required to safeguard the use, publication and disclosure of information on all
applicants for, and all clients who receive, services under the Contract in accordance with all
applicable federal and state law regarding confidentiality, which includes but is not limited to
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HIPAA, more specifically with the Privacy and Security Rules at 45 C.F.R. Part 160 and Part 164,
subparts A, C, and E; and

(c)  The State of Connecticut Agency named on page 1 of this Contract (“Agency”) is a “covered
entity” as that term is defined in 45 CF.R. § 160.103; and

(d)  The Contractor is a “business associate” of the Agency, as that term is defined in 45 C.F.R.
§ 160.103; and

(¢)  The Contractor and the Agency agree to the following in order to secure compliance with the
HIPAA, the requirements of Subtitle D of the Health Information Technology for Economic and
Clinical Health Act (‘HITECH Act”), (Pub. L. 111-5, §§ 13400 to 13423), and more specifically
with the Privacy and Secutity Rules at 45 C.F.R. Part 160 and Part 164, subpasts A, C, D and E
(collectively refetred to hetein as the “HIPAA Standards”).

® Definitions

(1)  “Breach” shall have the same meaning as the term is defined in section 45 C.F.R. 164.402
and shall also include an use or disclosure of PHI that violates the HIPAA Standards.

(2)  “Business Associate” shall mean the Contractor.

(3)  “Covered Entity” shall mean the Agency of the State of Connecticut named on page 1 of
this Contract.

(4  “Designated Record Set” shall have the same meaning as the term “designated record set” in
45 C.F.R. § 164.501.

(5)  “Electronic Health Record” shall have the same meaning as the term is defined in section
13400 of the HITECH Act (42 US.C. §17921(5).

(6)  “Individual” shall have the same meaning as the term “individual™ in 45 C.F.R. § 160.103
and shall include a person who qualifies as a personal representative as defined in 45 CF.R.
§ 164.502(g).

(7)  “Privacy Rule” shall mean the Standards for Privacy of Individually Identifiable Health
Information at 45 C.F.R. part 160 and part 164, subparts A and E.

(8)  “Protected Health Information” or “PHI” shall have the same meaning as the term
“protected health information” in 45 CF.R. § 160.103, and includes electronic PHI, as
defined in 45 C.F.R. 160.103, limited to information created, maintained, transmitted or
received by the Business Associate from or on behalf of the Covered Entity or from another
Business Associate of the Covered Entity.

(9)  “Required by Law’” shall have the same meaning as the term “required by law” in 45 C.F.R.
§ 164.103.

(10) “Secretary” shall mean the Secretary of the Department of Health and Human Services or

his designee.

(11) “More stringent” shall have the same meaning as the term “more stringent” in 45 C.F.R.
§ 160.202.

(12) “This Section of the Contract” refers to the HIPAA Provisions stated herein, in their
entirety.
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(13)

(14

(15)

“Security Incident” shall have the same meaning as the term “security incident” in 45 CF.R.
§ 164.304.

“Security Rule” shall mean the Security Standards for the Protection of Electronic Protected
Health Information at 45 C.F.R. patt 160 and part 164, subpart A and C.

“Unsecuted protected health information” shall have the same meaning as the term as
defined in 45 C.F.R. 164.402.

Obligations and Activities of Business Associates.

M

&)

®)

)

®)

©)

)

@

©)

Business Associate agrees not to use or disclose PHI other than as permitted or required by
this Section of the Contract or as Required by Law.

Business Associate agrees to use and maintain appropriate safeguards and comply with
applicable HIPAA Standatds with respect to all PHI and to prevent use or disclosure of PHI
other than as provided for in this Section of the Contract and in accordance with HIPAA
standards.

Business Associate agtees to use administrative, physical and technical safeguards that
reasonably and appropriately protect the confidentiality, integrity, and availability of
electronic protected health information that it creates, receives, maintains, or transmits on
behalf of the Covered Entity.

Business Associate agrees to mitigate, to the extent practicable, any harmful effect that is
known to the Business Associate of a use or disclosure of PHI by Business Associate in
violation of this Section of the Contract.

Business Associate agrees to repott to Covered Entity any use or disclosure of PHI not

; , agtees P yuse ¢ ° ol
provided for by this Section of the Contract or any secutity incident of which it becomes
aware.

Business Associate agrees, in accordance with 45 C.F.R. 502(e)(1)(i) and 164.308(d)(2), if
applicable, to ensure that any subcontractors that create, receive, maintain ot transmit
protected health information on behalf of the business associate, agree to the same
restrictions, conditions, and requirements that apply to the business associate with respect to
such information;.

Business Associate agrees to provide access (including inspection, obtaining a copy or both),
at the request of the Covered Entity, and in the time and manner designated by the Covered
Entity, to PHI in a Designated Record Set, to Covered Entity or, as directed by Covered
Entity, to an Individual in order to meet the requirements under 45 C.F.R. § 164.524.
Business Associate shall not charge any fees greater than the lesser of the amount charged by
the Covered Entity to an Individual for such records; the amount permitted by state law; or
the Business Associate’s actual cost of postage, labor and supplies for complying with the
request.

Business Associate agrees to make any amendments to PHI in a Designated Record Set that
the Covered Entity directs or agrees to pursuant to 45 CF.R. § 164.526 at the request of the
Covered Entity, and in the time and manner designated by the Covered Entity.

Business Associate agrees to make internal practices, books, and records, including policies
and procedures and PHI, relating to the use and disclosure of PHI received from, or created,
maintained, transmitted or received by, Business Associate on behalf of Covered Entity,
available to Covered Entity ot to the Sectetary in a time and manner agreed to by the parties
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(10)

(11

12)

(13)

14

15

(16)

or designated by the Secretary, for purposes of the Secretary investigating or determining
Covered Entity’s compliance with the HIPAA Standards..

Business Associate agrees to document such disclosures of PHI and information related to
such disclosures as would be required for Coveted Entity to respond to a request by an
Individual for an accounting of disclosures of PHI in accordance with 45 C.F.R. § 164.528
and section 13405 of the HITECH Act (42 U.S.C. § 17935) and any regulations promulgated
thereunder.

Business Associate agrees to provide to Covered Entity, in a time and manner designated by
the Covered Entity, information collected in accordance with subsection (g)(10) of this
Section of the Contract, to permit Covered Entity to respond to a request by an Individual
for an accounting of disclosures of PHI in accordance with 45 C.F.R. § 164.528 and section
13405 of the HITECH Act (42 U.S.C. § 17935) and any regulations promulgated thereunder.
Business Associate agrees at the Covered Entity’s direction to provide an accounting of
disclosures of PHI directly to an individual in accordance with 45 C.F.R. § 164.528 and
section 13405 of the HITECH Act (42 U.S.C. § 17935) and any regulations promulgated
thereunder.

Business Associate agrees to comply with any state or federal law that is moze stringent than
the Privacy Rule.

Business Associate agtees to comply with the requirements of the HITECH Act relating to
privacy and security that are applicable to the Covered Entity and with the requirements of
45 C.F.R. §§ 164.504(e), 164.308, 164.310, 164.312, and 164.316.

In the event that an individual requests that the Business Associate

(A) restrict disclosures of PHI;

(B) provide an accounting of disclosures of the individual’s PHI;

(C) provide a copy of the individual’s PHI in an electronic health record; ot
(D) amend PHI in the individual’s designated record set,

the Business Associate agrees to notify the Covered Entity, in writing, within five business
days of the request.

Business Associate agrees that it shall not, and shall ensure that its subcontractors do not,
directly ot indirectly, receive any remuneration in exchange for PHI of an Individual without

(A) the written approval of the coveted entity, unless receipt of remuneration in exchange
for PHI is expressly authorized by this Contract and

(B)  the valid authorization of the individual, except for the purposes provided under
section 13405(d)(2) of the HITECH Act, (42 U.S.C. § 17935(d)(2)) and in any

accompanying regulations
Obligations in the Event of a Breach.

(A)  The Business Associate agrees that, following the discovery by the Business Associate
or by a subcontractor of the Business Associate of any use or disclosure not provided
for by this section of the Contract, any breach of unsecured protected health
information, or any Security Incident, it shall notify the Covered Entity of such
breach in accordance with Subpart D of Patt 164 of Title 45 of the Code of Federal
Regulations and this Section of the Contract.
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©

)

E)

&)

Such notification shall be provided by the Business Associate to the Covered Entity
without unreasonable delay, and in no case later than 30 days after the breach is
discovered by the Business Associate, or a subcontractor of the Business Associate,
except as otherwise instructed in writing by a law enforcement official pursuant to 45
C.F.R. 164.412. A breach is considered discovered as of the first day on which it is, or
reasonably should have been, known to the Business Associate ot its subcontractor.
The notification shall include the identification and last known address, phone
number and email address of each individual (or the next of kin of the individual if the
individual is deceased) whose unsecured protected health information has been, or is
reasonably believed by the Business Associate to have been, accessed, acquired, or
disclosed during such breach.

The Business Associate agtees to include in the notification to the Covered Entity at
least the following information:

1. A description of what happened, including the date of the breach; the date of
the discovery of the breach; the unauthorized person, if known, who used the
PHI or to whom it was disclosed; and whether the PHI was actually acquited or
viewed.

2. A description of the types of unsecured protected health information that were
involved in the breach (such as full name, Social Security number, date of birth,
home address, account number, or disability code).

3. The steps the Business Associate recommends that Individual(s) take to protect
themselves from potential harm resulting from the breach.

4, A detailed description of what the Business Associate is doing or has done to
investigate the breach, to mitigate losses, and to protect against any further
breaches.

5. Whether a law enforcement official has advised the Business Associate, either

verbally or in writing, that he or she has determined that notification or notice
to Individuals or the posting required under 45 C.F.R. 164.412 would impede a
criminal investigation or cause damage to national security and; if so, contact
information for said official.

If directed by the Covered Entity, the Business Assoclate agrees to conduct a risk
assessment using at least the information in subparagraphs 1 to 4, inclusive of (g) (16)
(C) of this Section and determine whether, in its opinion, thete is a low probability
that the PHI has been compromised. Such recommendation shall be transmitted to
the Covered Entity within 20 business days of the Business Associate’s notification to
the Covered Entity.

If the Covered Entity determines that there has been a breach, as defined in 45 CF.R.
164.402, by the Business Associate or a subcontractor of the Business Associate, the
Business Associate, if directed by the Coveted Entity, shall provide all notifications
requited by 45 CF.R. 164.404 and 45 C.F.R. 164.406.

Business Associate agrees to provide appropriate staffing and have established
procedures to ensure that individuals informed of a breach have the opportunity to
ask questions and contact the Business Associate for additional information regarding
the breach. Such procedures shall include a toll-free telephone number, an e-mail
addtess, a posting on its Web site and a postal address. Business Associate agrees to
include in the notification of a breach by the Business Associate to the Covered
Entity, a written description of the procedures that have been established to meet

Page 8 of 12



these requirements. Costs of such contact procedures will be botne by the
Contractot.,

(G) Business Associate agrees that, in the event of a breach, it has the burden to
demonstrate that it has complied with all notifications requirements set forth above,
including evidence demonstrating the necessity of a delay in notification to the
Covered Entity.

(h)  Permitted Uses and Disclosure by Business Associate.

(1)  General Use and Disclosute Provisions Except as otherwise limited in this Section of the
Contract, Business Associate may use ot disclose PHI to petform functions, activities, or
services for, ot on behalf of, Covered Entity as specified in this Contract, provided that such
use or disclosure would not violate the HIPAA Standatds if done by Covered Entity or the
minimum necessary policies and procedures of the Covered Entity.

(2)  Specific Use and Disclosure Provisions

(A)  Except as otherwise limited in this Section of the Contract, Business Associate may
use PHI for the proper management and administration of Business Associate or to
carry out the legal responsibilities of Business Associate.

(B)  Except as otherwise limited in this Section of the Contract, Business Associate may
disclose PHI for the proper management and administration of Business Associate,
provided that disclosures are Required by Law, or Business Associate obtains
reasonable assurances from the petson to whom the information is disclosed that it
will remain confidential and used or further disclosed only as Required by Law or for
the putpose for which it was disclosed to the person, and the person notifies Business
Associate of any instances of which it is awate in which the confidentiality of the
information has been breached.

(C)  Except as otherwise limited in this Section of the Contract, Business Associate may
use PHI to provide Data Aggregation setvices to Covered Entity as permitted by 45
C.F.R. § 164.504(e)(2)[D)(B).

@ Obligations of Covered Entity.

(1)  Covered Entity shall notify Business Associate of any limitations in its notice of privacy
ptactices of Covered Entity, in accordance with 45 C.F.R. § 164.520, or to the extent that
such limitation may affect Business Associate’s use or disclosure of PHI.

(2)  Covered Entity shall notify Business Associate of any changes in, or revocation of,
permission by Individual(s) to use ot disclose PHI, to the extent that such changes may
affect Business Associate’s use or disclosure of PHI.

(3)  Covered Entity shall notify Business Associate of any restriction to the use or disclosure of
PHI that Covered Entity has agreed to in accordance with 45 C.E.R. § 164.522, to the extent
that such restriction may affect Business Associate’s use or disclosure of PHI.

0 Permissible Requests by Covered Entity. Covered Entity shall not request Business Associate to
use or disclose PHI in any mannet that would not be permissible under the HIPAA Standards if
done by the Covered Entity, except that Business Associate may use and disclose PHI for data
aggtregation, and management and administrative activities of Business Associate, as permitted
under this Section of the Contract.

(k) Term and Termination.
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Term. The Term of this Section of the Contract shall be effective as of the date the Contract
is effective and shall terminate when the information collected in accordance with provision
(2)(10) of this Section of the Contract is provided to the Covered Entity and all of the PHI
provided by Covered Entity to Business Associate, or created or received by Business
Associate on behalf of Covered Entity, is destroyed or returned to Covered Entity, or, if it is
infeasible to return or destroy PHI, protections ate extended to such information, in
accordance with the termination provisions in this Section.

Termination for Cause Upon Covered Entity’s knowledge of a material breach by Business
Associate, Covered Entity shall either:

(A)  Provide an opportunity for Business Associate to cure the breach or end the violation
and terminate the Contract if Business Associate does not cure the breach or end the
violation within the titne specified by the Covered Entity; or

(B) Immediately terminate the Contract if Business Associate has breached a material term
of this Section of the Contract and cuze is not possible; or

(C)  If neither termination nor cure is feasible, Covered Entity shall report the violation to
the Secretary.

Effect of Termination.

(A)  Except as provided in (k)(2) of this Section of the Contract, upon termination of this
Contract, for any reason, Business Associate shall return or destroy all PHI received
from Covered Entity, ot created, maintained, or received by Business Associate on
behalf of Covered Entity. Business Associate shall also provide the information
collected in accordance with section (g)(10) of this Section of the Contract to the
Covered Entity within ten business days of the notice of termination. This section
shall apply to PHI that is in the possession of subcontractors or agents of Business
Associate. Business Associate shall retain no copies of the PHI

(B) In the event that Business Associate determines that returning or destroying the PHI
is infeasible, Business Associate shall provide to Covered Entity notification of the
conditions that make return ot destruction infeasible. Upon documentation by
Business Associate that return or destruction of PHI is infeasible, Business Associate
shall extend the protections of this Section of the Contract to such PHI and limit
further uses and disclosures of PHI to those purposes that make return or desttuction
infeasible, for as long as Business Associate maintains such PHI. Infeasibility of the
return or destruction of PHI includes, but is not limited to, requirements under state
or federal law that the Business Associate maintains or preserves the PHI or copies
thereof.

Miscellaneous Sections.

M

@

3)

Regulatory References. A reference in this Section of the Contract to a section in the Privacy
Rule means the section as in effect or as amended.

Amendment. The Parties agree to take such action as in necessary to amend this Section of
the Contract from time to time as is necessaty for Covered Entity to comply with
requitements of the Privacy Rule and the Health Insurance Portability and Accountability
Act of 1996, Pub. L. No. 104-191.

Survival. The respective rights and obligations of Business Associate shall survive the
termination of this Contract.
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(#)  Effect on Contract. Except as specifically required to implement the purposes of this Section
of the Contract, all other terms of the Contract shall remain in force and effect.

(5)  Construction. This Section of the Contract shall be construed as broadly as necessary to
implement and comply with the Privacy Standard. Any ambiguity in this Section of the
Contract shall be resolved in favor of a meaning that complies, and is consistent with, the
Privacy Standard.

(6)  Disclaimer. Covered Entity makes no warranty ot representation that compliance with this
Section of the Contract will be adequate o satisfactoty for Business Associate’s own
purposes. Covered Entity shall not be liable to Business Associate for any claim, civil ot
criminal penalty, loss or damage related to or arising from the unauthorized use or disclosure
of PHI by Business Associate ot any of its officers, directors, employees, contractors ot
agents, or any third party to whom Business Associate has disclosed PHI contrary to the
sections of this Contract or applicable law. Business Associate is solely responsible for all
decisions made, and actions taken, by Business Associate regarding the safeguarding, use and
disclosure of PHI within its possession, custody or control.

(7)  Indemnification. The Business Associate shall indemnify and hold the Covered Entity
harmless from and against any and all claims, liabilities, judgments, fines, assessments,
penalties, awards and any statutory damages that may be imposed or assessed pursuant to
HIPAA, as amended or the HITECH Act, including, without limitation, attorney’s fees,
expert witness fees, costs of investigation, litigation or dispute resolution, and costs awarded
thereunder, relating to or arising out of any violation by the Business Associate and its
agents, including subcontractors, of any obligation of Business Associate and its agents,
including subcontractors, undet this section of the contract, under HIPAA, the HITECH
Act, and the HIPAA Standards.

Part 1T, Section E.8 of this contract, is hereby deleted and the following is substituted in lieu thereof:

E8

Executive Orders. This Contract is subject to Executive Otder No. 3 of Governor Thomas J. Meskill,
promulgated June 16, 1971, concerning labor employment practices; Executive Order No. 17 of Governor
Thomas J. Meskill, promulgated Februaty 15, 1973, concerning the listing of employment openings;
Executive Order No. 16 of Governor John G. Rowland, promulgated August 4, 1999, concerning violence
in the workplace, all of which ate incorporated into and made a part of the Contract as if they had been fully
set forth in it. The Contract may also be subject to Executive Order 14 of Governor M. Jodi Rell,
promulgated April 17, 2006, concerning procurement of cleaning products and services and to Executive
Otder No. 49 of Governor Dannel P. Malloy, promulgated May 22, 2015, mandating disclosure of certain
gifts to public employees and contributions to cettain candidates for office. If Executive Order 14 and/or
Executive Order 49 are applicable, they are deemed to be incotporated into and are made a part of the
Contract as if they had been fully set forth in it. At the Contractor’s request, the Client Agency or the DAS
shall provide a copy of these orders to the Contractor.

All terms and conditions of the original Contract, and any subsequent amendments thereto, which were not
modified by this Amendment remain in full force and effect.
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties have executed this Conttact amendment by their duly authorized
representatives with full knowledge of and agreement with its tetms and conditions.

SIGNATURES AND APPROVALS
12DDS0709BT Amendment 1

The Contractor IS NOT a Business Associate under the Health Insurance Portability and Accountability Act of 1996
as amended.

CONTRACTOR - CAPITOL REGION EDUCATION COUNCIL

e Ghos i

GREG]. FLORI E\emth' Dnm‘oz Date

OFFICE OF EARLY CHILDHOOD

%// %%W 6 /L9 12

DAVID \WILI&NSON Au‘m{g Comniissioner Date

(\/La\c]j(e H’dcurl o(«-(f.% dothorieed

CONNECTICUT ATTORNEY GENERAL (APPROVED AS TO FORM)

ASST. / Assoc. Attorney General Date
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NONDISCRIMINATION CERTIFICATION

JANUARY 2016

Amendments to the Connecticut General Statues Sections 4a-60 and 4a-60a have been adopted. As a result
of these amendments, the corresponding certifications have been revised as described below. Please note
that the effective date of this amendment is January 15, 2016.

Directions: Please complete ONE of the following forms:

III.  For ENTITIES (defined as cotporations, limited liability companies, or partnerships)

contracting with the State with contracts valued $50,000 or more during any year of the
contract period:

Form C (Affidavit by Entity) is a certification through a sworn affidavit (it must be notarized)

to be completed if the entity already has in place a nondiscrimination policy that complies with
C.G.S. 4a-60 and 4a-60a as amended.



Form C
01-15-2016

STATE OF CONNECTICUT
NONDISCRIMINATION CERTIFICATION — Affidavit

By Entity
For Contracts Valued at $50,000 or More

Documentation in the form of an affidavit signed under penalty of false statement by a chief executive
officer, President & CEQ, chairperson, member, or other corporate officer duly authorized to adopt
corporate, company, or partnership policy that certifies the contractor complies with the
nondiscrimination agreements and warranties under Connecticut General Statutes §§ 4a-60 and 4a-60a,
as amended

INSTRUCTIONS:
For use by an entity (corporation, limited liability company, or partnership) when entering into any contract
type with the State of Connecticut valued at $50,000 or more for any year of the contract. Complete all

sections of the form. Sign form in the presence of a Commissioner of Superior Court or Notary Public.
Submit to the awarding State agency prior to contract execution.

AFFIDAVIT:

I, the undersigned, am over the age of eighteen (18) and understand and appreciate the obligations of an oath.
I am Executive Director of Capitol Region Education Council, an entity duly formed and existing under
the laws of the State of Connecticut. I certify that I am authorized to execute and deliver this affidavit on
behalf of Capitol Region Education Council and that Capitol Region Education Council has a policy in place
that complies with the nondiscrimination agreements and warranties of Connecticut General Statutes {§ 4a-

60 and 4a-60a, as amended.

=

Greg lorlo

Sworn and subscribed to before me on this ?5 day of Sm L ,20_17) .

bi»\LVLU @vau\/ 4 30\.3“0%

Comml.shoner of the Supenor Court/ Commission Expiration Date
Notary Public




OPM Ethics Form 1 Rev. 5-26-15
Page 1 of 2

8 BT 9
¢ 3

#%,4Y  STATE OF CONNECTICUT

b

:-_«_—»@E‘.‘zﬂ};; = GIFT AND CAMPAIGN CONTRIBUTION CERTIFICATION

sy
Written or electronic certification to accompany a State contract with a value of $50,000 or more in
a calendar or fiscal year, pursuant to C.G.S. §§ 4-250 and 4-252(c) and C.G.S. §9-612(g)(2) and
Governor Dannel P. Malloy’s Executive Order 49.

INSTRUCTIONS:

Complete all sections of the form. Attach additional pages, if necessary, to provide full disclosure about any lawful campaign
contributions made to campaigns of candidates for statewide public office or the General Assembly, as described herein. Sign and date
the form, under oath, in the presence of a Commissioner of the Superior Court or Notary Public. Submit the completed form to the
awarding State agency at the time of initial contract execution and if there is a change in the information contained in the most recently
filed certification, such person shall submit an updated certification either (i) not later than thirty (30) days after the effective date of
such change or (i) upon the submittal of any new bid or proposal for a contract, whichever is earlier. Such person shall also submit an
accurate, updated certification not later than fourteen days after the twelve-month anniversary of the most recently filed certification or

updated certification.

CHECK ONE: [] Initial Certification B 12 Month Anniversary Update (Multi-year contracts only.)

O Updated Certification because of change of information contained in the most
recently filed certification or twelve-month anniversary update.

GIFT CERTIFICATION:

As used in this certification, the following terms have the meaning set forth below:

1) “Contract” means that contract between the State of Connecticut (and/or one or more of it agencies or instrumentalities) and the
Contractor, attached hereto, or as otherwise described by the awarding State agency below;

2) If this is an Initial Certification, “Execution Date” means the date the Contract is fully executed by, and becomes effective
between, the parties; if this is a twelve-month anniversary update, “Execution Date” means the date this certification is signed by
the Contractor;

3) “Contractor” means the person, firm or corporation named as the contactor below;

4) “Applicable Public Official or State Employee” means any public official or state employee described in C.G.S. §4-252(c)(1)(i) or (ii);

5) “Gift” has the same meaning given that term in C.G.S. § 4-250(1);

6) “Principals or Key Personnel” means and refers to those principals and key personnel of the Contractor, and its or their agents, as

described in C.G.S. §§ 4-250(5) and 4-252(c)(1)(B) and (C).

I, the undersigned, am a Principal or Key Personnel of the person, firm or corporation authorized to execute this certification on behalf
of the Contractor. I hereby certify that, no gifts were made by (A) such person, firm, corporation, (B) any principals and key personnel
of the person firm or corporation who patticipate substantially in preparing bids, proposals or negotiating state contracts or (C) any
agent of such, firm, corporation, or principals or key personnel who participates substantially in preparing bids, proposals or negotiating
state contracts, to (i) any public official or state employee of the state agency or quasi-public agency soliciting bids or proposals for state
contracts who participates substantially in the preparation of bid solicitations or request for proposals for state contracts or the
negotiation or award of state contracts or (i) any public official or state employee of any other state agency, who has supervisory or
appointing authority over such state agency or quasi-public agency.

I further certify that no Principals or Key Personnel know of any action by the Contractor to circumvent (or which would result in the
circumvention of) the above certification regarding Gifts by providing for any other Principals, Key Personnel, officials, or employees
of the Contractor, or its or their agents, to make a Gift to any Applicable Public Official or State Employee. I further certify that the
Contractor made the bid or proposal for the Contract without fraud or collusion with any person.



OPM Ethics Form 1 Rev. 5-26-15
Page 2 of 2

CAMPAIGN CONTRIBUTION CERTIFICATION:

I further certify that, on or after December 31, 2006, neither the Contractor nor any of its principals, as defined in C.G.S. § 9-612(g)(1),
has made any campaign contributions to, or solicited any contributions on behalf of, any exploratory committee, candidate
committee, political committee, or party committee established by, or supporting or authorized to support, any candidate for statewide
public office, in violation of C.G.S. § 9-612(g)(2)(A). I further certify that all lawful campaign contributions that have been made on
or after December 31, 2006 by the Contractor or any of its principals, as defined in C.G.S. § 9-612(g)(1), to, or solicited on behalf of,
any exploratory committee, candidate committee, political committee, or party committee established by, or supporting or authorized
to support any candidates for statewide public office or the General Assembly, are listed below:

Lawful Campaign Contributions to Candidates for Statewide Public Office:

Contribution Date Name of Contributor Recipient Value Description

Lawful Campaign Contributions to Candidates for the General Assembly:

Contribution Date Name of Contributor Recipient Value Description
Sworn as true to the best of my knowledge and belief, subject to the penalti lse statement,
Capitol Region Education Council M}
Printed Contractor Name Greg lorio, E,{x cutive Director
Subscribed and acknowledged before me this B day of ‘\V‘V\L—- 20 )

M it Qi

Commiissioner of the éupenor Court or Notary Public




OPM Ethics Form 5 Rev. 3-28-14

., STATE OF CONNECTICUT
.. CONSULTING AGREEMENT AFFIDAVIT

Aff davit to accompany a bid or proposal for the purchase of goods and services with a value of $50,000
or more in a calendar or fiscal year, pursuant to Connecticut General Statutes §§ 4a-81(a) and 4a-
81(b). For sole source or no bid contracts the form is submitted at time of contract execution.

INSTRUCTIONS:

If the bidder or vendor has entered into a consulting agreement, as defined by Connecticut General Statutes § 4a-81(b)(1): Complete
all sections of the form. If the bidder or contractor has entered into more than one such consulting agreement, use a separate form for each
agreement. Sign and date the form in the presence of a Commissioner of the Superior Court or Notary Public. If the bidder or contractor has
not entered into a consulting agreement, as defined by Connecticut General Statutes § 4a-81(b)(1): Complete only the shaded section of
the form. Sign and date the form in the presence of a Commissioner of the Superior Court or Notary Public.

Submit completed form to the awarding State agency with bid or proposal. For a sole source award, submit completed form to the awarding State
agency at the time of contract execution.

This affidavit must be amended if there is any change in the information contained in the most recently filed affidavit not later than (i) thirty
days after the effective date of any such change or (if) upon the submittal of any new bid or proposal, whichever is carlier.

AFFIDAVIT: [Number of Affidavits Sworn and Subscribed On This Day: |
I, the undersigned, hereby swear that I am a principal or key personnel of the bidder or contractor awarded a contract, as described in

Connecticut General Statutes § 4a-81(b), or that I am the individual awarded such a contract who is authorized to execute such contract. 1
further swear that I have not entered into any consulting agreement in connection with such contract, except for the agreement listed below:

Consultant’s Name and Title Name of I'irm (if applicable)

Start Date End Date Cost

Description of Services Provided:

Is the consultant a former State employee or former public official? [] YES ] NO

If YES:
Name of Former State Agency Termination Date of Employment

Sworn as true to the best of my knowledge and belief, subject to the penaltiesol)false statement.

Capitol Region Education Council
Printed Contractor Name

?/ecutive Director

Office of Early Childhood
Awarding State Agency

Subscribed and acknowledged before me this % day of /\M , 2047\

,\j)i WM Q,MDJ) ()

Commisdioner of the Supenor Court or Notary Public




OPM Iran Certification Form 7 (Rev. 3-28-14) Page 1 of 1

STATE OF CONNECTICUT

Weritten or electronic PDF copy of the written certification to accompany a large state contract pursuant to
P.A. No. 13-162 (Prohibiting State Contracts With Entities Making Certain Investments In Iran)

Respondent Name: Capitol Region Education Council

INSTRUCTIONS:
CHECK ONE: O Initial Certification.
X Amendment or renewal.

A. Who must complete and submit this form. Effective October 1, 2013, this form must be submitted for any large state contract, as defined in
section 4-250 of the Connecticut General Statutes. This form must always be submitted with the bid or proposal, or if there was no bid process, with the
resulting contract, regardless of where the principal place of business is located.

Pursuant to P.A. No. 13-162, upon submission of a bid or prior to executing a large state contract, the certification portion of this form must be
completed by any corporation, general partnership, limited partnership, limited liability partnership, joint venture, nonprofit organization or other
business organization whose principal place of business is located outside of the United States. United States subsidiaries of foreign corporations
are exempt. For purposes of this form, a “foreign corporation™ is one that is organized and incorporated outside the United States of America.

Check applicable box:
m Respondent’s principal place of business is within the United States or Respondent is a United States subsidiary of a foreign corporation.
Respondents who check this box are not required to complete the certification portion of this form, but must submit this form with its
Invitation to Bid (“ITB”), Request for Proposal (“RFP”) or contract package if there was no bid process.
[ Respondent’s principal place of business is outside the United States and it is not a United States subsidiary of a foreign corporation.
CERTIFICATION required. Please complete the certification portion of this form and submit it with the I'TB or RFP response or contract
package if there was no bid process.
B. Additional definitions.
1)  “Large state contract” has the same meaning as defined in section 4-250 of the Connecticut General Statutes;
2)  “Respondent” means the person whose name is set forth at the beginning of this form; an
3) “State agency” and “quasi-public agency” have the same meanings as provided in section 1-79 of the Connecticut General Statutes.
C. Certification requirements.
No state agency or quasi-public agency shall enter into any large state contract, or amend or renew any such contract with any Respondent whose principal
place of business is located outside the United States and is not a United States subsidiary of a foreign corporation unless the Respondent has submitted

this certification.

Complete all sections of this certification and sign and date it, under oath, in the presence of a Commissioner of the Superior Court, a Notary Public or a
person authorized to take an oath in another state.

CERTIFICATION:
1, the undersigned, am the official authorized to execute contracts on behalf of the Respondent. 1 certify that:

[[] Respondent has made no direct investments of twenty million dollars or more in the energy sector of Iran on or after October 1, 2013, as described in
Section 202 of the Comprehensive Iran Sanctions, Accountability and Divestment Act of 2010.

[] Respondent has either made direct investments of twenty million dollars or more in the energy sector of Iran on or after October 1, 2013, as described
in Section 202 of the Comprehensive Iran Sanctions, Accountability and Divestment Act of 2010, or Respondent made such an investment prior to
October 1, 2013 and has now increased or renewed such an investment on or after said date, or both.

Sworn as true to the best of my knowledge and belief, subject to the penalties of false statement.

Capitol Region Education Council

Greg J. Florio, Executive Director

Subscribed and acknowledged before me this day of » 20

Commissioner of the Superior Court (or Notary Public)

My Commission Expires



